

## DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard . Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Purchasing Agent 813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 794-2111 727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484 352/ 524-2221 e-mail: nwestmor@pasco.k12.fl.us

June 17, 2014

## **MEMORANDUM**

TO: Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Purchasing Agent

RE: Request Permission to "Piggy-Back" the School Board of Marion County Bid #3492JM, Electrical Supplies CED Raybro Electric Supply Mayer Electric Supply

We are requesting permission to utilize the School Board of Marion County Bid #3492JM, Electrical Supplies. Per DOE Rule 6A-1.012(5) the District may make purchases at the unit prices in contracts awarded by other governmental agencies. Considering a competitive process was conducted by the School Board of Marion County that resulted in an award for Electrical Supplies, CED Raybro Electric Supply and Mayer Electric Supply are both willing to extend (attached) the same terms and conditions of this bid to our District for the period of June 17, 2014 through April 30, 2015. This contract has been reviewed and approved by Nancy Alfonso, School Board Attorney on April 27, 2014.

Maintenance Services is requesting permission to place purchase orders not to exceed \$150,000 utilizing Capital Outlay Funds. The Purchasing Services Department will monitor and calculate all purchase orders to the above-referenced vendor to verify that the dollar limit is not exceeded.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if I can be of further assistance, please feel free to contact Debra Reaves, Purchasing Services at your earliest convenience.

NW/dr Attachment(s)

Date/Time: June 11, 2014 08:54:00

(813) 794-2000 • (352) 524-2000 • (727) 774-2000 • www.pasco.k12.fl.us



## DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard . Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

332/ J24-2222 e-mail. m	3/ 794-2484 westmor@pasco.k12.fl.us
	BID PIGGYBACK REQUEST BID #3492JM, School Board of Marion County BID TITLE: Electrical Supplies
	Yes, I agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggyback Bid # 3492JM, Electrical Supplies, under the same terms and conditions. The coverage period shall be effective from the contract dates of May 20, 2014 throug April 30, 2015.
	No, I do not agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggybac Bid # 3492JM.
COMPANY NAME: May	er Electric Supply
SIGNATURE:	- yim Unistian
TYPED NAME AND TIT	LE: Jim Christian, Contract Administrator (Person authorized to bind your company)
TELEPHONE (WITH AR	REA CODE): 800-996-2937
	REA CODE): <u>855-271-0867</u>
E-MAIL ADDRESS: jch	ristian@mayerelectric.com
DATE:	4/29/14
neither it nor its princi	r certifies, by submission and signature of this piggyback request form, that pals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared y excluded from participation in this transaction per the provisions of Florid
	DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY ATTENTION: Debra Reaves, Buyer Assistant

District Wide Accreditation . Southern Association of Colleges and Schools



## DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard . Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Pun 813/ 794-2222 Fax: 813/ 794 727/ 774-2222 TDD: 813/ 794 352/ 524-2222 e-mail: nwestr	-2111
	BID PIGGYBACK REQUEST BID <u>#3492JM, School Board of Marion County</u> BID TITLE: <u>Electrical Supplies</u>
Bid # cover	I agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggyback 3492JM, Electrical Supplies, under the same terms and conditions. The age period shall be effective from the contract dates of May 20, 2014 through 30, 2015.
	do not agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggyback 3492JM.
COMPANY NAME: CED Ray	bro Electric Supply
	ehel
TYPED NAME AND TITLE: C	Chad Rudd, Manager (Person authorized to bind your company)
TELEPHONE (WITH AREA C	ODE): <u>352-629-7991</u>
FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA	CODE): <u>352-368-6884</u>
E-MAIL ADDRESS: chad@ce	edocala.com
DATE: 4/2	7/14
neither it nor its principals a	ifies, by submission and signature of this piggyback request form, that are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared luded from participation in this transaction per the provisions of Florida
PLEASE FAX BACK TO:	DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY ATTENTION: Debra Reaves, Buyer Assistant

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

20430 GATOR LAND LAND O' LAKES, FL 34638 (813) 794-2219 (PHONE) (813) 794-2111 (FAX)

SCHOO	L BOARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPO	RTUNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"					
Bid Tal	bulation Poste	d: April 4, 2014							
BID 34									
Bid Tit	le: Electrical S	Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 2	2015						
	And the House of the second	oril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM							3
	Date: April 22								
		t: Technical Services							
	ted Resources							1	
Duuge	leu Resources	\$85,000							
			Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Distribute CED Rayb Supply, Ir	ted Electrical ors, Inc. dba oro Electrical ving, TX and ala, FL	Mayer Elec Compa Birmingh	ctric Supply any, Inc., am, AL and pa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc. Miami, FL
			Vendor ID	BATTERY_002	CED/F	RAYB000	Mayer	_EL001	NEW
			Drug Free	Y	1.0.1	Y		Y	N
			Mfg's Authorization	Y		Y	in a second second	Y	N
			Certificate of Liability	N		Y	aria se a se	Y	N
		Co	mmon Carrier Waiver	Y	L	ocal	a Gastin and	Y	N
		Certifi	cation for Debarment	Y		Y		Y	N
		Pref	erence Document / %	Florida	Using Star	o Preference ndard 5% per da Law	Alabama - 3	% Preference	Florida
		Red	lacted Copy Provided	N		N		N	N
		Qu	alification Statement	Y		Y		Y	Y
			W-9			Y		Y	N
#	Unit	Description	CIMS Item#	Unit Price	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price
		Category I - Percentage Off							
	Leviton								
1	%	Surge Protectors	NA	N. P.	55		57	1	
2	%	Leviton Balance of Line	NA	No Bid	55	•	57	]	
	Hubbell			C					
3	%	Surge Protectors	NA	/	1	/	40		1
4	%	Receptacles	NA	1 /			58	-	
5	%	Switches	NA	NgBid		/	58		
6	%	Covers	NA		/	/	58		
7	%	Caps & Covers	NA	] /			58		
8	%	All other	NA		/		45		V
	Intermatic								

SCHOC	L BOARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPOR	TUNITY SCHOO	L DISTRICT"			
		d: April 4, 2014					
BID 34							
1. 2017 March 1.6 - 2.6		Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 20	)15				
		oril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
	Date: April 22						
		t: Technical Services					
	ted Resources						-
Duuge	leu nesources						
			Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electr Distributors, Inc. d CED Raybro Electri Supply, Irving, TX a Ocala, FL	Iba Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., ical Birmingham Al and	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
9	%	Surge Protectors	NA	No Bid	40	43	
	Light Bulbs	by Manufacturer					
10	%	Acuity	NA	1		50	/
11	%	Archipelago	NA			30	
12	%	Cree	NA			45	
13	%	Feit	NA			50	
14	%	GE	NA	No/Bid		87	
15	%	Halco	NA			40	
16	%	Lednovation	NA			30	
17	%	Lumen-Starr	NA			30	
18	%	Phillips	NA	V		87	
	Miscellaneo	US					
19	%	EMT	NA		60	70	
20	%	PVC	NA		87	90	
21	%	Greenfield - (Alum.)	NA	/	75	80	
22	%	Sealtite	NA	/	70	75	
23	%	Copper Wire (except SJ Cord.)	NA		65	71	
24	%	Aluminum Wire	NA	/	75	78	
25	%	Steel City	NA		70	85	
26	%	RACO	NA			90	
27	%	Bridgeport	NA			80	
28	%	Caddy - Erico Products (Blackburn)	NA		65	50	
29	%	Kindorf Fittings	NA	1 /		69	
30	%	OZ./Gedney	NA		65	60	
31	%	Midwest Disconnects	NA		1	45	
32	%	Arrow Hart: Switches	NA		/	40	
33	%	Cord Caps	NA			55	

Electrical Supplies 3492JM TABSHEET 4-4-14.xls

SCHOO	L BOARD OF N	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTU	NITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
		ed: April 4, 2014					
BID 34							
	A DEREM A DOCUMENT	Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 2015					
		pril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
	Date: April 22						
		nt: Technical Services					
	ted Resources						
Duuge	leu Resource:	\$ \$00,000	A HELEN				
		5	Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc. Miami, FL
34	%	Buss: Fuses	NA	No/Bid		68	1 1
35	%	Gould-Shawmut: Fuses	NA	1 /		68	1 /
36	%	Plymouth: All Miscellaneous	NA	1 /		15	1 /
37	%	G.E.: Ballast	NA	1 /		88	1 /
38	%	Appleton	NA	1 /	65	50	1 /
39	%	Electro line (Thomas & Betts)	NA			50	1 /
40	%	Perfect Line (Thomas & Betts)	NA	1 /	65	70	1 /
41	%	Red Dot (Thomas & Betts)	NA	1 /	65	80	1 /
42	%	Regal	NA	1 /		60	1 /
43	%	Killark	NA	1 /		25	7 /
44	%	ILSCO	NA	1 /		50	7 /
45	%	Burndy	NA	1/		65	7/
46	%	Wire Mold	NA	1/	25	31	7/
47	%	Universal	NA	1/		88	1/
48	%	Ideal	NA	1/	32	40	7/
49	%	3M (Electrical)	NA	V	30	30	
	Bryant						
50	%	Surge Protectors	NA	/		35	/
51	%	Receptacles	NA			50	
52	%	Switches	NA	NoBid		50	
53	%	Covers	NA			50	
54	%	Caps & Covers	NA			50	
55	%	All other	NA	/		45	/
	Lithonia						
56	%	Wraparounds/ Lay ins	NA	No-Bid	45	55	
57	%	Emergency Lighting	NA		45	55	
	Metalux						

Electrical Supplies 3492JM TABSHEET 4-4-14.xls

SCHOO	L BOARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUM	VITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
		d: April 4, 2014					
BID 349							
		Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 2015	er (12)				
		oril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM		2			
	Date: April 22						
		nt: Technical Services					
Budget	ted Resources	\$ \$85,000					
			Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
58	%	Wraparounds/ Lay ins	NA	1.0	35	50	
59	%	Emergency Lighting	NA	No-BIO	35	50	
	Hubbell						
60	%	Wraparounds/ Lay ins	NA			45	
61	%	Emergency Lighting	NA	No Bid		43	
62	%	Caps	NA			45	
	Columbia	(1997) <b>1</b> - 1978					
63	%	Wraparounds/ Lay ins	NA	11.00		50	
64	%	Emergency Lighting	NA	No-Bid		45	
	Atlas			~			
65	%	Atlas Lighting Products	NA	No Bid	45	51	
	ITE	5 5		-			
66	%	Motor Controls	NA	/		45	15
67	%	Breakers Bi/Panels	NA			60	15
68	%	Breakers Si/Panels	NA	NoBid		60	15
69	%	Transformers	NA			60	15
70	%	Disconnects	NA			70	15
	G.E.						
71	%	Motor Controls	NA	/		45	15
72	%	Breakers Bi/Panels	NA			65	15
73	%	Breakers Si/Panels	NA	No Bid		65	15
74	%	Transformers	NA			62	15
75	%	Disconnects	NA			63	15
	Square D						
76	%	Motor Controls	NA		10	NQ	15
77	%	Breakers Bi/Panels	NA		10	46.2	15
78	%	Breakers Si/Panels	NA	No Bid	40	46.2	15

SCH	OOL BO	OARD OF MA	RION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPF	ORTUNITY SCHOO	L DISTRICT"			1
			: April 4, 2014					
-	3492JI	A STATE OF THE STA						
A CONTRACTOR OF A			pplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30	2015				
			il 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM	, 2010				
		e: April 22, 2					<u>.</u>	
			: Technical Services					
Bud	geted	Resources \$	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
79		%	Transformers	NA	/	10	10	
80		%	Disconnects	NA	/	25	NO	15
					·		Not an Authorized Square D Distributor	Not an Authorized Square D Distributor
		Cutler Hamm	er					
81		%	Motor Controls	NA			43 41.71	15
82		%	Breakers Bi/Panels	NA			<b>60</b> 58.2	15
83		%	Breakers Si/Panels	NA	No Bid		<b>60</b> 58,2	15
84		%	Transformers	NA			<b>55</b> 53.35	15
85		%	Disconnects	NA			<b>60</b> 58,2	15
		SPORTSLIG	HTERS			-		
		General Elec	tric: (1500 Watt Metal Halide)					
86		%	Integral Ballast Multi-Tap	NA	No-BIO		37	
87		%	Remote Ballast Multi-Tap	NA	NUCOIU		37	
		Hubbell: (150	0 Watt Metal Halide)					
88		%	Integral Ballast Multi-Tap	NA	No-Bid		37	
89		%	Remote Ballast Multi-Tap	NA	BIO		37	
		Lithonia: (150	00 Watt Metal Halide)					
90		%	Integral Ballast	NA	No-BIO	18	40	
91		%	Remote Ballast	NA	BIU	18	40	
		MUSCO: (15	00 Watt Metal Halide)					
92		%	Integral Ballast	NA	No-BIO		NO	
93		%	Remote Ballast	NA				
			Category II - Unit Pricing					
#	Est. Qty	Unit	Description	CIMS Item#	2			
94	40	Bag of 100	WIRE TIES NYLON 6" Black ONLY	8399000839		\$2.56	\$3.50	

SCH	IOOL B	OARD OF MA	RION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTL	JNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
Bid	Tabula	ation Posted	: April 4, 2014					
BID	3492J	M						
Bid	Title:	Electrical Su	pplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
Lanor			il 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
		e: April 22, 3			107			
			: Technical Services					
Bud	Igeted	Resources \$	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc. Miami, FL
95	100	Bag of 100	WIRE TIES NYLON 7.5" Black ONLY	8399000840		\$2.53	\$4.00	
96	150	Bag of 100	WIRE TIES NYLON 11.5" Black ONLY	8399000841	1	\$4.21	\$5.50	
97	50	Bag of 100	WIRE TIES NYLON 14.5" Black Only	8399000842	1 /	\$5.12	\$6.50	
98	300	Each	TAPE SCOTCH 33	8399000812	1 /	\$3.91	\$3.68	
99	90	Each	3" CAUTION TAPE, YELLOW	8399000814	1 /	\$7.65	\$9.00	
100	20	Each	2' BLUE NORDX PATCH CORDS AX350001	8390000034	1 /		\$4.00	
101	150	Per 100	CONN GREENFIELD ST ½ BRIDGEPORT STEEL ONLY	8385000001			\$50.00	
102	150	Each	ADAPTOR MALE PVC 1/2	8384000001	1 /	\$0.08	\$0.10	
103	50	Each	ADAPTOR MALE PVC 3/4	8384000002	1	\$0.13	\$0.17	
104	50	Per 100	COUP COMP 1/2 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383100001	] [	\$22.00	\$22.00	
105	10	Each	COUP COMP 1 1/2 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383100005		\$1.22	\$1.35	
106	300	Each	CONN SET SCREW 1/2 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383200001		\$0.11	\$0.11	
107	65	Each	CONN SET SCREW 3/4 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383200002	1	\$0.16	\$0.19	
108	65	Each	GROUND ROD 5/8 X 8' GALV.	8382508505	] ]	\$5.39	\$6.50	
109	200	Each	CONN COMP 1/2 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383000001	] [	\$0.18	\$0.19	
110	35	Each	CONN COMP 3/4 EMT, STEEL ONLY	8383000002	] [	\$0.25	\$0.27	
111	40	Each	20A, 3 wire, Female Cord Cap, 125V, Leviton Mfg. # 5369-C	8376001000		\$12.47	\$10.50	
112	150	Each	15A, 3 wire, Male Cord Cap, 125V, Leviton Mfg. # 5266-C	8377000001		\$4.77	\$4.00	
113	10	Each	20A, 250V, Male Plug, Leviton Mfg. # 5466-C	8377000005		\$7.06	\$6.50	
114	50	Each	90 deg., 15A, 115V Male Grnd., Leviton Mfg. # 5256-VB	8377000002		\$3.53	\$4.00	

.

SCH	IOOL BO	DARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORT	UNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			1
Bid	Tabula	tion Poster	d: April 4, 2014					
BID	3492JN	W						
Bid	Title: E	Electrical S	upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
1.000.000.000	12 Contract Contractor		ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
	200 march 100 march 1	e: April 22,						
			t: Technical Services					
Buc	Igeted I	Resources	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
115	350	Each	Receptacle, Duplex 5800-I 20A, 125V, Leviton Mfg. # CR20-I	8378001000		\$1.00	\$0.95	
116	200	Each	Receptacle., GFI, 20A, Leviton Mfg. # 7899-I	8378001002		\$8.24	\$7.50	
117	55	Each	Receptacle., Single, 5801-I 20A, 125V, Leviton Mfg. # 5801-I	8378001004		\$1.18	\$2.00	
118	300	Each	Receptacle, Duplex 5320 BR 15A, 125V, Leviton Mfg. # 5320-I	8378001001		\$0.83	\$0.85	
119	20	Each	Receptacle, Single, 5821-I 20A, 250V, Leviton Mfg. # 5821-I	8378001011		\$1.77	\$3.00	
120	10	Each	Receptacle, Clock, 15A, 125V, Leviton Mfg., # 688-I	8378001005		\$3.30	\$5.00	
121	15	Each	PHOTOCELL TWIST 120/277V LC4536C, INTERMATIC	8364900080		\$10.51	\$9.75	
122	40	Each	INTERMATIC PHOTOCELL, POST (K4021C), NIPPLE (K4121C), or SWIVEL (K4221C), 120V	8364900081		\$9.55	\$7.75	
123	10	Each	INTERMATIC PHOTOCELL, NIPPLE (K4123C), 277V	8364900082		\$10.91	\$10.00	
124	170	Each	Switch, SP, AC Quiet, 20A, Leviton Mfg., # 1221- 2I	8370000000		\$2.06	\$2.50	
125	20	Each	Switch, 3 Way, 20A, Leviton Mfg., # CS320-21	8370000034	No Bid	\$2.24	\$2.50	
126	5	Each	Switch, AC Quiet, 4 Way, 20A, Leviton Mfg., # CS420-2I	8370000007		\$7.06	\$5.00	
127	20	Each	Switch, SP, 3 Way, 20A, Quiet, Leviton Mfg. # CS320-2I	8370000078		\$2.24	\$2.50	
128	150	Each	Switch, SP Out, Leviton Mfg., # 5225-I	8370000073		\$5.89	\$4.50	
129	10	Each	Switch, AC Locking, 3 Way Key, Leviton Mfg. # 1223-2IL	8370000062		\$7.06	\$6.00	

Bid	Tabulat	tion Poste	d: April 4, 2014					
	3492JN							
			Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
			ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
		e: April 22,						
		Service in the service of starting services of starting	t: Technical Services					
Bud	geted F	Resources	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc Miami, FL
130	100	Each	TAMPERPROOF SWITCH, KEY ONLY FOR LEVITON P/N 000-555-000-PRT	8370000059		\$2.36	\$2.75	
131	300	Each	Cover, SS, Receptacle, 1 Gang Duplex, Leviton Mfg. # 84003	8306104100		\$0.71	\$0.70	
132	300	Each	Cover, SS, Switch, 1 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84001	8306104101		\$0.71	\$0.70	
133	100	Each	Cover, SS, Blank, 1 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84014	8306104102		\$0.71	\$0.70	_
134	50	Each	Cover, SS, 1 Receptacle, 1 Gang, 15A, Leviton Mfg. # 84004-40	8306104103		\$0.71	\$0.70	_
135	20	Each	Cover, SS, 1 Receptacle, 1 Gang, 20A, Leviton Mfg.# 84020-40	8306104104		\$1.42	\$1.50	
136	5	Each	Cover, SS, 1 Receptacle., 1 Gang, 30A, Leviton Mfg. # 84020-40	8306104105		\$1.42	\$1.50	
137	5	Each	Cover, SS, 1 Receptacle, 2 Gang, 30A, Leviton Mfg. # 84046-40	8306104106		\$1.65	\$1.75	
138	20	Each	Cover, SS, 1 Duplex, 1 Sing, Leviton Mfg. # 84026	8306104107		\$1.42	\$1.50	
139	20	Each	Cover, SS, 2 Duplex, 2 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84016	8306104108		\$1.42	\$1.50	
140	5	Each	Cover, SS, Comb., 2 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84005	8306104109		\$1.42	\$1.50	
141	15	Each	Cover, SS, Switch, 2 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84009	8306104110		\$1.42	\$1.50	
142	15	Each	Cover, SS, Blank, 2 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84034- 40	8306104111		\$2.83	\$3.00	
143	5	Each	Cover, SS, 2 Switch, 1 Duplex, 3 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84021-40	8306104112		\$3.33	\$6.00	
144	10	Each	Cover, SS, 3 Switch, 3 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84011	8306104113		\$2.12	\$2.25	
145	10	Each	Cover, SS, 4 Switch, 4 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84012	8306104114		\$2.83	\$3.00	

SCH	OOL BO	OARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTL	JNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"					
			d: April 4, 2014							
BID	3492JI	M								
			upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5	č				Real Providence	
			ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM							
		e: April 22,								
			t: Technical Services							
Bud	lgeted	Resources	\$85,000							
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Distribut CED Rayt Supply, Ir	ted Electrical ors, Inc. dba oro Electrical ving, TX and ala, FL	Compa Birmingha	ctric Supply any, Inc., am, AL and pa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
146	5	Each	Cover, SS, 5 Switch, 5 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84023-40	8306104115		\$5.18		\$7.50		
147	5	Each	Cover, SS, Blank, 5 Gang, Leviton Mfg. # 84065- 40	8306101519		\$8.24		\$10.00		
148	10	Each	FLY FAN SWITCH BZE6-2RQ, LEVITON	8370600200	] [			\$55.00		
149	75	Each	1/0 AI/Cu CRIMP SLEEVE, BURNDY	8362000001		\$5.21		\$5.70		
150	2	Each	SQD LC1D0910G6/8502 PD2.10, LIFT STA. (Ft McCoy) CONT/W COIL	8364600001		\$64.69		\$66.00		
151	5	Each	261DT 120V ALTER RELAY SWITCH	8364600007	1	\$48.88		\$110.00		
152	30	Each	MULTI400 W MET HALIDE BALLAST	8352200053	1	\$53.41		\$51.00		
153	75	Each	LEV. PIN SOCKET #13053-UN, LEVITON	8352602001	1	\$2.36		\$1.50	1	
154	235	Each	BATTERY, POWER SONIC 1270 12V/6.5A, POWER SONIC or WERKER	8351901245	\$15.89	\$16.22	\$17.0310	\$16.20	\$16.6860	
155	25	Each	BATTERY, POWER SONIC 670 6V/7A, POWER SONIC or WERKER	8351907008	\$8.69	\$10.58	\$11.1090	\$11.00	\$11.3300	
156	400	Each	BATTERY EMERGENCY (SMALL) PS640F, 6V/4.5A, POWER SONIC or WERKER	8351907009	\$5.49	\$5.65	\$5.9325	\$6.25	\$6.4375	
157	40	Each	BATTERY, 12180NB, 12V/18A, POWER SONIC or WERKER	8351901246	\$39.99	\$68.17	\$71.5785	\$45.00	\$46.3500	
158	100	Each	1 BULB T-8 ELECTRONIC BALLAST, 120/277 (NO UNIVERSAL BALLAST)	8352000019		\$13.10		\$8.75		
159	415	Each	2 BULB T-8 ELECTRONIC BALLAST, 120/277 (NO UNIVERSAL BALLAST)	8352101005		\$10.23		\$8.75		
160	200	Each	3 BULB T-8 ELECTRONIC BALLAST, 120/277 (NO UNIVERSAL BALLAST)	8352000103		\$11.36		\$9.65		
161	660	Each	4 Bulb T-8 ELECTRONIC BALLAST, 120/277 (NO UNIVERSAL BALLAST)	8352000018		\$12.50		\$10.40		

SCH	OOL BO	DARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORT	UNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"					
Bid	Tabula	tion Poste	d: April 4, 2014							
BID	3492J	VI								
Bid	Title: E	Electrical S	Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5						- I - Deservice
Date	8. Tim	e Due: Ap	ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM							
Boa	rd Date	e: April 22,	2014							
			t: Technical Services							
Bud	geted I	Resources	\$85,000							
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Distribut CED Rayt Supply, Ir	ted Electrical ors, Inc. dba oro Electrical ving, TX and ala, FL	Compa Birmingha	ctric Supply my, Inc., am, AL and pa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc. Miami, FL
162	200	Each	F96 T8 ELECTRONIC HO BALLAST, 120/277	8352000006		\$30.59		\$30.00		
163	275	Each	PSQ-500 EMERGENCY BALLAST (POWER SENTRY ONLY)	8352000100		\$56.00		\$58.00		
164	40	Each	PS 1400 BALLAST (POWER SENTRY ONLY)	8352000101		\$90.94		\$89.00		
165	20	Each	SENSOR SWITCH, PP20	8306104150		\$31.11		\$30.50		
166	30	Each	SENSOR SWITCH, WSDWH	8306104152		\$42.00		\$31.25		
167	5	Each	SENSOR SWITCH, CM-9	8306104153		\$66.67		\$65.25		
168	5	Each	SENSOR SWITCH, CM-9R	8306104155	1			\$72.00		
169	85	Each	FIXTURE WRAPAROUND 4'2 BULB 120V, Lithonia LB232MVOLTGEB10IS, BULB 120V	8350000005		\$50.67		\$50.25		
170	5	Each	TLB232120-1/4GEB 8' 4 TUBE WRAP, Lithonia	8350000007		\$93.78		\$94.00		3
171	50	Each	KENALL H69FL FIXTURE	8350001069		\$47,50		\$46.00		
172	30	Each	YLS150 HPS DUSK TO DAWN W/YARM24 ASSY.	8350505000		\$76.41		\$61.00		
173	240	Each	LITHONIA LQMSW3R120/277ELN EXIT LIGHT, COOPER AP70R	8350606002		\$35.56		\$16.00		
174	75	Each	EMERGENCY LITE MULE SQ-80	8350707000	1	\$18.23	<b>I</b>	\$17.00		
175	25	Each	ELM EMERG LIGHT LITHONIA 6v/11w 120/277v	8350707001		\$35.78		\$32.00		
176	20	Each	SHADE FIXTURE FLO 4' WRAP #DLB48	8350900050		\$20.72	ľ	\$20.50		
177	10	Each	FUSE 15A 600V SLO BLO, TRS15R	8349802016		\$6.52	\$6.8460	\$4.50	\$4.6350	\$10.23
178	15	Each	FUSE 20A 600V, TRS20	8349802020	1	\$6.52	\$6.8460	\$4.50	\$4.6350	\$10.23
179	5	Each	FUSE 25A 600V, OTS25	8349802025		\$5.49	\$5.7645	\$5.65	\$5.8195	\$20.23
180	10	Each	FUSE 30A 600V, TRS30	8349802030		\$6.52	\$6.8460	\$4.50	\$4.6350	\$10.23
181	5	Each	FUSE 50A 600V, OTS50	8349802060		\$8.19	\$8.5995	\$8.00	\$8.2400	\$20.23

SCH	OOL B	OARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORT	UNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
-			d: April 4, 2014					
	3492J							
Bid	Title:	Electrical S	Supplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
Date	e & Tin	ne Due: Ap	ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
		e: April 22,						
Bud	lgeted	Departmen	t: Technical Services					
Bud	lgeted	Resources	\$85,000					
			r	Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrica Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham Al and	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
182	130	Each	FIXTURE LAY IN 2 X 4/ 2 BULB 120V, LITHONIA	8350000001		\$43.33	\$44.00	
183	55	Each	BREAKER SQ.D SP 20A	8334000102		\$7.39	\$15.05	\$50.25
184	5	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 2P 30A	8334000203		\$16.20	\$36.04	\$50.25
185	6	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 2P 60A, SNAP-IN	8334000206		\$16.20	\$36.04	\$50.25
186	10	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 2P, 100A	8334000210		\$64.64	\$191.70	\$141.75
187	4	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 3P 30A, SNAP-IN	8334000303		\$72.56	\$133.42	\$186.00
188	5	Each	BREAKER SQ.D GFI 20A	8334006102		\$64.86	\$125.00	\$174.75
189	4	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 2P 20A, BOLT-IN	8334601202		\$49.64	\$47.88	\$66.75
190	2	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 3P 50A, BOLT-IN	8334601305		\$163.39	\$157.63	\$219.75
191	2	Each	BREAKER SQ.D 3P 100A, BOLT-IN	8334607310		\$233.66	\$225.42	\$314.25
192	1	Each	Square D Only – NQ Panel Board N3R 400A M/B has 5-2P100 and 22-1P20 Space	NA		\$1,284.09		$\Lambda$ /
193	1	Each	Square D Only - NQ Panel Board N3R 200AMP MCB has 5-2P100 & 32-1P20 Spaces	NA		\$1,306.82		
194	1	Each	Square D Only-NQ MB Panel Board (Interior) NQ Panel board consisting of: 208Y/120 VAC 3PH 4W 60 HZ SCCR:10K Main: 400A LA Circuit Breaker ULSE Incoming Conductor(s): (1)#1-600 kcmil or (2)#1-250 kcmil; BUS: Copper Silver/Tin Plating; CU Ground Bar; Type 3R/12, 65"Hx20"W x6.25"D; Incoming: Bottom, Box Cat# MH65WP, Front Cat# TRIM w/ Box, Ref, Drawing: PBA510; PBA 511 Branches: (2) 30A/3P QOB, (5) 100A/2P QOB; Special: Copper Solid Neutral	NA		\$1,348.84	NO	
195	1	Each	Square D Only-EE75T3H – 75KVA Transformer	NA		\$1,672.16	] /	\$7,044.00
196	1	Each	Square D Lug Kit-DASKP250	NA		\$17.85		\$130.50

SCH	OOL BO	DARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPOR	TUNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
Bid	Tabula	tion Poster	d: April 4, 2014					
BID	3492JM	M						
Bid	Title: E	Electrical S	upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 20	015				
Date	e & Tim	e Due: Ap	ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
		e: April 22,						
			t: Technical Services					
	-	Resources						
	9							
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrica Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrica Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Company, Inc.,	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
197	1	Each	Square D Lug Kit-DASKP600	NA		\$63.73	17	\$136.50
198	1	Each	Square D Only-WS364 TFMR Weathershield	NA		\$91.35		\$209.07
						Reserves and the second se	Not an Authorized	Not an Authorized
							Square D Distributor	Square D Distributor
199	55	Each	BREAKER ITE SP 20A	8333000102			\$3.50 \$3.6050	\$35.63
200	4	Each	BREAKER ITE 2P 20A, BOLT-IN	8333601202			<b>\$27.25</b> \$28.0675	\$50.00
201	40	Each	STRAP, MADISON	8306904200		\$0.16	\$0.19	
202	4500	Ft	CONDUIT, EMT 1/2"	8301100001		\$0.22	\$0.22	
203	1400	Ft	CONDUIT, EMT 3/4"	8301100002		\$0.36	\$0.35	
204	485	Ft	CONDUIT, EMT 1"	8301100003		\$0.60	\$0.60	
205	165	Ft	CONDUIT, EMT 2"	8301100006		\$1.43	\$1.42	
206	230	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 1/2"	8301200001		\$0.16	\$0.15	
207	465	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 3/4"	8301200002		\$0.19	\$0.18	
208	400	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 1"	8301200003		\$0.27	\$0.26	
209	2100	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 2"	8301200006		\$0.58	\$0.56	
210	70	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 2 1/2"	8301200007		\$0.98	\$0.95	- 11
211	210	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 3"	8301200008		\$1.20	\$1.17	
212	1025	Ft	CONDUIT, PVC 4"	8301200010	NoBid	\$1.65	\$1.61	- 11
213	265	Ft	1/2 GREENFIELD ALUMINUM	8301300001		\$0.36	\$0.34	
214	300	Ft	SEALTITE 1/2"	8301400001		\$0.43	\$0.47	
215	300	Ft	SEALTITE ¾"	8301400002		\$0.62	\$0.63	
216	55	Ft	SEALTITE 1"	8301400003		\$0.91	\$0.92	- 11
217	50	Each	SEALTITE 1/2" STRAIGHT CONNECTOR	8386000001		\$1.04	\$0.85	
218	25	Each	SEALTITE 3/4" STRAIGHT CONNECTOR	8386000002		\$1.69	\$1.50	
219	25	Each	SEALTITE 1/2" 90deg CONNECTOR	8386100001		\$1.67	\$1.70	
220	25	Each	SEALTITE ¾" 90deg CONNECTOR	8386100002		\$2.63	\$2.51	
221	10	Each	1/2 OFFSET NIPPLE	8301600001	1	\$1.34	\$1.34	

SCH	OOL B	OARD OF M	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTU	JNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
Bid	Tabula	tion Poster	d: April 4, 2014					
BID	3492JI	M						
Bid	Title: I	Electrical S	upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
Date	e & Tim	ne Due: Ap	ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
Boa	rd Date	e: April 22,	2014					
Bud	Igeted	Departmen	t: Technical Services					
Bud	lgeted	Resources	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
222	16	Each	V-517 INTERNAL ELBOW, IVORY, WIREMOLD	8302105007		\$1.59	\$1.50	
223	45	Each	V-511 FLAT ELBOW, IVORY, WIREMOLD	8302105008		\$1.26	\$1.19	
224	785	Each	V-500 RACEWAY, IVORY, 10 FT SECTION, WIREMOLD	8302105009		\$0.88	\$0.81	
225	75	Each	V-5751 EXTENSION ADAPTOR, IVORY, WIREMOLD	8302305000		\$4.93	\$4.65	
226	180	Each	V-5703 SUPPORT CLIP, IVORY, WIREMOLD	8302305019		\$0.35	\$0.34	
227	15	Each	WIREMOLD MALE BOX CONN	8302305049		\$2.36	\$2.25	
228	2	Each	25DTP-415 TELEPOWER POLE, WIREMOLD	8302800000	1	\$180.28	\$165.00	
229	10	Each	25DTP-412 TELEPOWER POLE, WIREMOLD	8302800001		\$140.13	\$105.00	
230	115	Each	V-5748 BOX w/BOTTOM, IVORY, WIREMOLD	8302605052		\$5.53	\$5.21	
231	50	Each	V-5748-2 2-GANG BOX w/BOTTOM, WIREMOLD	8302605053		\$9.95	\$9.35	
232	30	Each	V-5745 BOX w/ BOTTOM, WIREMOLD	8302605036		\$5.61	\$5.28	
233	30	Each	5782 FEMALE CONDUIT CONNECTOR, WIREMOLD	8302305051		\$2.46	\$2.31	
234	50	Each	5782 MALE CONDUIT CONNECTOR, WIREMOLD	8302305049		\$2.36	\$2.23	
235	40	Each	CONDULET OLB 1/2", W/GASKET & COVER, STEEL ONLY, THREADED	8303000000		\$4.15	\$3.75	
236	10	Each	ENTRANCE ELL 1/2" SLB	8303000200		\$2.72	\$2.75	
237	115	Each	1/2" RIGID STRAP ONE HOLE	830400000		\$0.06	\$0.06	
238	95	Each	3/4" RIGID STRAP ONE HOLE	8304000001		\$0.08	\$0.07	4
239	20	Each	UNISTRUT 1 1/2"X 10', Steel	8304100402		\$12.10	\$12.50	_
240	35	Each	UNISTRUT 3/4" X 10' LGT, Steel	8304100403	-	\$8.67	\$8.70	
241	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 GREEN, STRANDED (500')	830500000		\$54.28	\$53.00	_
242	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 WHITE, STRANDED (500')	8305000001		\$54.28	\$53.00	

SCH	OOL BO	DARD OF MA	ARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTO	JNITY SCHOO	DL DISTRICT"			
Bid	Tabula	tion Postec	I: April 4, 2014					
11 C	3492JN							
Bid	Title: E	Electrical S	upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30, 201	5				
Date	e & Tim	e Due: Apr	ril 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM					
Boa	rd Date	: April 22,	2014					
Bud	geted I	Department	t: Technical Services					
Bud	geted F	Resources	\$85,000					
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Consolidated Electrical Distributors, Inc. dba CED Raybro Electrical Supply, Irving, TX and Ocala, FL	Mayer Electric Supply Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL	Miami Breaker Inc., Miami, FL
243	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 BLACK, STRANDED (500')	8305000002		\$54.28	\$53.00	
244	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 RED, STRANDED (500')	8305000003		\$54.28	\$53.00	
245	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 BLUE, STRANDED (500')	8305000010		\$54.28	\$53.00	
246	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 GREEN, SOLID (500')	8305000000		\$47.31	\$46.00	
247	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 WHITE, SOLID (500')	8305000001		\$47.31	\$46.00	
248	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 BLACK, SOLID (500')	8305000002		\$47.31	\$46.00	
249	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 RED, SOLID (500')	830500003		\$47.31	\$46.00	
250	10	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 12 BLUE, SOLID (500')	8305000010		\$47.31	\$46.00	
251	15	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 10 GREEN, STRANDED (500')	8305000011		\$83.00	\$80.00	
252	7	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 10 WHITE, STRANDED (500')	8305000012		\$83.00	\$80.00	
253	6	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 10 BLACK, STRANDED (500')	8305000013	1	\$83.00	\$80.00	
254	4	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 10, RED, STRANDED (500')	8305000014	1 1	\$83.00	\$80.00	
255	5	Roll	WIRE, THHN CU 10 BLUE, STRANDED (500')	8305000021		\$83.00	\$80.00	
256	5800	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #8	8305000022		\$0.27	\$0.26	
257	6500	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #6	8305000023	1	\$0.41	\$0.40	
258	1100	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #4	8305000024	11	\$0.63	\$0.62	
259	1400	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #2	8305000026		\$1.00	\$0.97	
260	3100	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #1	8305000027		\$1.29	\$1.26	
261	600	Ft	WIRE, THHN CU #1/0	8305000028		\$1.54	\$1.51	_
262	6400	Ft	WIRE, #4, USE AL (1000' SPOOLS ONLY)	8305202001		\$0.19	\$0.19	
263	37000	Ft	WIRE, #1/0, USE AL	8305202004		\$0.45	\$0.45	
264	1700	Ft	WIRE, #2/0, USE AL	8305202005		\$0.53	\$0.52	-
265	500	Each	BOX, 4 SQ. w/ RAISED GROUND, 1/2 & 3/4 KO, 1-1/2 D	8306001004		\$0.49	\$0.51	
266	30	Each	BOX, 4 SQ., 1/2 & 3/4 KO, 2-1/8 D	8306001010		\$0.83	\$0.80	
267	30	Each	BOX, WATERPROOF, 3 HOLE 1/2"dia	8306807000		\$1.96	\$31.60	

			RION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPO	SRTUNITY SCHOL	DL DISTRICT"					
			: April 4, 2014							
	3492J		upplies - Term: April 25, 2015 to April 30,	2015						
			il 2, 2014 @ 2:00 PM	2010				3		
	and the state of t	e: April 22,								
			: Technical Services							
	-	Resources								
				Vendors	LTL Enterprise dba The Battery Bank, Apopka, FL	Distribut CED Ray Supply, I	ted Electrical ors, Inc. dba bro Electrical rving, TX and ala, FL	Mayer Electric Supp Company, Inc., Birmingham, AL and Tampa, FL		Miami Breaker Inc Miami, FL
					1			Note:	T&B S47	
268	50	Each	HANGER BAR, SUSPENDED CEILING	8306900016		\$4.32	]	\$4.40		
					]]			and the second se	addy 512	
269	140	Each	COVER, 4 SQ., BLANK	8306101151	1	\$0.23		\$0.23		4 1
270	40	Each	COVER, WP, BLANK, 1 GANG	830670702		\$0.56	]	\$0.59		. [
271	25	Each	COVER, WP, DUPLEX, 1 GANG	8306707022		\$1.84		\$1.75		
272	65	Each	COVER, WP, GFI RECEPTACLE	8306707023		\$4.01		\$2.75		
273	100	250 pack	30-1033J 3 PORT CONNECTOR, IDEAL	8399000825		\$24.74		\$18.00		
274	40	25 pack	30-372 DISCONNECT, IDEAL	8399000824		\$23.05		\$5.38		
								And a state of the	2 100 per pack	4/
275	50	100 pack	30-073 ORANGE WIRE NUT, IDEAL	8399000830		\$6.75		\$5.61		
276	10	100 pack	30-451 YELLOW WIRE NUT, IDEAL	8399000831	-	\$7.15		\$7.40	1	1
277	10	100 pack	30-072 BLUE WIRE NUT, IDEAL	8399000843		\$5.29		\$5.39		
			In-Store Discount							
278		%	Walk-In Purchases		N/A		N/A	1	N/A	
	_				state vendors biddi	ng. These te	1, 237, 262, 263, n (10) items were witnessed by Jim	e decided by in	dividual coin toss	tate vendors with no in ses, conducted by Rick

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COL	NTY EL OPIDA "	NEOUAL	OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"					1
		IN EQUAL	OFFORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT					1
Bid Tabulation Posted: April 4,	2014							
BID 3492JM		1		-				
Bid Title: Electrical Supplies - T	erm: April 25, 2	015 to Apr	il 30, 2015					
Date & Time Due: April 2, 2014	@ 2:00 PM							
Board Date: April 22, 2014								
Vendor Name - No Response								
Vendor Marine - No Response		-						
Accu-Tech Corporation	Tampa	FL	Graybar Electric	Gainesville	Florida	PROCURE INC.	NARBERTH	PA
ACF Standby Systems, LLC	Tampa	FI	Green Green Lighting	Ocala	FL	Pyramid School Products	Tampa	FL
ACP STANDBY Systems, LLC AFP INDUSTRIES, INC.	SOUTH MIAMI	FLORIDA	HAMMOND ELECTRONICS/EMSCO	ORLANDO	FLORIDA	RAJ & Associates, LLC	Crystal River	Florida
AIW Inc	Orlando	FL	HD Supply Facilities Maintenance	San Diego	CA	Bexel	Ocala	FL
Aldan Electric Supply of Lake County, Inc.	Eustis	FL	HD SUPPLY FACILITIES MAINTENANCE, LTD.	SAN DIEGO	CA	RGF Communications Inc.	palm bay	fl
Aldan Electric Supply of Lake County, Inc.	Orlando	FI	HD Supply Power Solutions	Ocala	fl	Safety Products, Inc	Lakeland	FL
American Cable Services	Ocala	FL	HILL MANUFACTURING COMPANY, INC.	ATLANTA	GA	scandium Dba apexiamps	Alhambra	Ca
American Product Distributors, Inc.	Charlotte	NC	Home Depot U.S.A., Inc.	Atlanta	GA	Scott Electric	Greensburg	PA
AMHER CORP	St Petersburg	FL	Interline Brands, Inc./DBA Sexauer	Jacksonville	FL	Servc Group	Hollywood	CA
APPLIED INDUSTRIAL TECHNOLOGIES INC.	TAMPA	FLORIDA	ITW Inc dba AAA Tool & Supply	Pompano	Florida	Sharrer Electric Co., Inc.	Ocala	Florida
Asset Lighting & Electric, Inc.	Lakewood	NJ	keylon lighting services	BROOKSVILLE	fl	Shine Company Inc.	High Springs	Florida
Audio Visual Solutions Corporation	Hollywood	FL	Kratos Public Safety and Security Solutions Inc.	Orlando	FL	SILMAR ELECTRONICS	CLEARWATER	FLORIDA
Authorized Power Systems	New Port Richey	FL	L&S Enterprises, LLC	Port Orange	FL	Sitler's Supplies, Inc	Washington	lowa
Batteries Plus LLC	HARTLAND	wi	LED DISTRIBUTORS OF FLORIDA, LLC	OCALA	FL	Stokes Electric of Central Fla Inc.	Ocala	FL
Battle & Battle Distributors	Decatur	Georgia	Leedy Electric	Mulberry	Fl	Sunshine Lighting	Brooklyn	New York
BDI	GROTON	CT	Lowe's	ocala	fl	Tampa Armature Works	Orlando	FL
Besco Electric Supply	Leesburg		M. Gay Constructors, Inc.	Jacksonville	Fl	TBF Computing, Inc.	Marietta	GA
CDW Government	Vernon Hills	IL	MARION SUPPLY, LLC	OCALA	FLA	The Home Depot, Inc.	New Smyrna Beach	FL
Central Florida Electric, inc.	Ocala	FL	Mayer Electric Supply Co., Inc	Birmingham	Alabama	Theatrical Bulb Supply	Waterloo	IL
C-Land Manufacturing	Ocala	FL	McGraw-Hill Construction	ORLANDO	FL	TI Electric USA INC	West Palm Beach	Florida
Compass Solar Energy	Pensacola	FL	McKinley Group International Co. WLL	Kuwait	Kuwait	Tradewinds Power Corp.	Sebring	Florida
Competitive Edge	Schererville	IN	MC5 of Tampa, Inc.	Tampa	Florida	Tri-City Electrical Contractors, Inc.	Ocala	FL
Construction DataFax, Inc.	Montevallo	AL	MetroServices	Albany	GA	upsystems, inc	oldsmar	florida
Construction Software Technologies, Inc.	Cincinnati	ОН	Mid State Builders Exchange	Ocala	FL	V-Blox	Jacksonville	FL
Cousin's Video	Painesville	Ohio	Midwest Concepts Corporation	Omaha	NE	Venergy Group, LLC	Fort Pierce	Florida
Decorative Designs Paints & Coatings	Ocala	Florida	Modern Imaging Solutions	Canoga Park	California	VSC, Inc.	Novi	MI
Diversified Electrical Systems, Inc	Palm City	FL.	Motion Industries	Jacksonville	FL	W. W. Gay Fire & Integrated Systems, Inc.	Jacksonville	Florida
Diversified Technology Group, Inc.	Largo	Florida	MSC Industrial Supply Co.	Orlando	FL	W.W. Grainger, Inc.	Alpharetta	Ga
Dugmore & Duncan Inc	Hingham	MA	MyProjectorLamps.com	Miami Beach	Florida	WALKER MILLER EQUIPMENT INC.	Orlando	Florida
Duval Electrical & Breaker Sales	Jacksonville	Florida	Northwest Lighting Systems Co	Coon Rapids	MN	Zabatt Inc.	Jacksonville	FL
DXP Enterprises	Orlando	FL	On-Site Power, Inc	Ocala	FL			
Electric Services, Inc.	Leesburg	FI	P&L Supply	North Little Rock	AR			
Elite Screens	Cerritos	CA	PAI	Cleveland	ОН	Vendor Name - No Bid		
Encore Electric, Inc	Ocala	FL	Palmer Electric	Winter Park	Florida			
Energy Reapers Inc.	Thonotosassa	FI	Parker Stephens Inc	Tampa	FL	Automated Buildings, Inc.	Orlando	Florida
ERIN ELECTRICAL ENTERPRISES, INC	BOYNTON BEACH	FL	Parts Associates Inc	Cleveland	ОН	Mouser Electronics	Mansfield	TX
ez power	ocala	FL	Pinnacle Construction Partners	Nashville	TN			
General Mechanical Corporation	Daytona Beach	FL	Precision Contracting Services, Inc.	Jupiter	FL			and the second
George Scott & Associates	Charlotte	hc	Prime Electric LLC	Leesburg	FL			
Global Tradequest	Rochester	NY	Prime Vendor Inc.	Wilmington	NC			